
BISCUITS

Great Offers on Parle Products at all Smart Bazaar stores
Note: MRP (`) inclusive of all taxes for given NetWeight, Offer available in select geographies, Offer available till stocks last , Stocks also available without offer.

MRP ` 170 `8570707
Net Weight: 250 g

MRP ` 170 `8570707
Net Weight: 250 g

MRP ` 150 `7550505
Net Weight: 400 g

MRP ` 140 `7040404
Net Weight: 396 g

MRP ` 180 `9080808
Net Weight: 495 g

Hide & Seek Choco Rolls Hide & Seek Milano Centre Filled

MRP ` 270 `1352702707
Net Weight: 1 kg

Nutricrunch Digestives

Hide & Seek Creme Sandwiches Happy Happy Cookies Fab! Jam-in

20-20 Gold Cashew Cookies

Net Weight: 604.8 g
MRP ` 1601601606 `80

MRP ` 2502502505
Net Weight: 1 Kg

`125

Net Weight: 412.5 g
MRP ` 150 `10050505

MRP ` 75 `497575

MRP ` 140

`70
40404

Net Weight: 200 g

Hide & Seek Milano RangeHide & Seek Choco Fills

Hide & Seek Choco Chip CookiesMonaco Crackers

MRP ` 120 `80202020
Net Weight: 700 g

MRP ` 120 `80202020
Net Weight: 700 g

KrackJack Crackers

Net Weight: 700 g

MRP ` 160 `8060606
Net Weight: 500 g

Fab! Bourbon

MRP ` 1757575
Net Weight: 800 g `88et Weight: 800 g MRP ` 150 `7550505

Net Weight: 500 g

20-20 Nice Coconut Biscuits

MRP ` 40 `20404040

Parle’s Wafers
Net Weight: 75 gNet Weight: 70 g Net Weight: 70 g Net Weight: 70 g

Buy one Get one FREE

Other Exciting Offers

Net Weight: 120 g
Net Weight: 125 g Net Weight: 125 g

Net Weight: 125 g

Parle Marie
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THERAJASTHANHigh Court on
Tuesday granted parole to self-
styledgodmanAsaramBapu,82,
whoisservingalifesentencefor
rapingaminor,toundergotreat-
ment for seven days at an
Ayurvedic hospital in
Maharashtra under police cus-
tody.
“He has been granted seven

days parole, excluding time of
travel, at our own cost,” one of
the lawyers, who represented
Asaram,toldTheIndianExpress.
The parole was granted by a
bench of Justices Pushpendra
Singh Bhati and Munnuri
Laxman.
Asaramwill undergo treat-

ment at the Madhavbaug
Multidisciplinary Cardiac Care
hospital inMaharashtra.
Consideringthenatureofthe

case, “the Rajasthan Policewill

coordinatewith relevant police
authoritiesinMaharashtratoen-
surewhateversafetyorsecurity
is required,” the lawyer said.
Currently, Asaram is under-

going treatment at AIIMS,

Jodhpur,wherehewasadmitted
on Friday following pain in his
chest. After an emergency
checkup,hewassent to thecar-
diaccareunit.
Asaramwassentencedtolife

in prison in April 2018 by a
Jodhpurcourtwhich foundhim
guiltyofrapinga16-year-oldgirl
inoneof his ashrams in2013.
Asaram, alias Ashumal, was

charge-sheetedonNovember6,
2013 and after a trial lasting al-
most five years, theMagistrate,

Special Court, Protection of
Children from Sexual Offences
(POCSO) Act, 2012, Jodhpur,
Rajasthan, convicted him on
April25,2018.Hewasconvicted
for the offences under Sections
370(4), 342, 354-A, 376(2)(f),
376-D,506,509/34and120-Bof
the Indian Penal Code (IPC),
1860, Sections 23 and 26 of the
Juvenile Justice (Care and
Protection of Children) Act,
2000,andSections5(f)/6,5(g)/6,
and8of thePOCSOAct.

InJanuary2023,Asaramwas
sentenced to life imprisonment
byaGandhinagarsessionscourt
afterholdinghimguiltyforrape
andunnatural sex in a case reg-
istered in 2013 for raping a
woman disciple, who hailed
fromSurat,onseveraloccasions
from 2001 to 2006 when she
was living at his ashram at
Motera near Ahmedabad. The
courthadalso imposeda fineof
Rs 50,000onAsaramtobepaid
ascompensation to thevictim.
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AWOMAN in Nagaur district
wasallegedlythrashedbyheral-
coholichusband,tiedtoamotor-
cycle and dragged around a vil-
lage,police saidonTuesday.
The video claiming to show

thewomantiedtothemotorcy-
cle and being dragged surfaced
online onMonday after which
the police took action and ar-
rested theman.
According toNagaur police,

the man identified as
PremaramMeghwal (28) who
was inan inebriatedstatehada
fight with his wife after he got
angry with the way she talked
tohismother. Inabidtopunish
her forthisact,hetiedhertohis
bike and later dragged her
aroundthevillage.The incident
was recorded by a bystander
who later sent it to Meghwal's
sister-in-law.
The incident is said to have

taken place around a month
back in Naharsinghpura village
under Panchaudi police station

area in thedistrict.
Nagaur Superintendent of

Police,NarayanTogaswhiletalk-
ing to The Indian Express said
theyhavetakensuo-motoaction
against the man and have ar-
restedhim.
“Afterwe saw the video, we

arrested the man though the
woman did not file any formal
complaint.Sheissettoreturnto
Nagaur soon as she went to
Jaisalmertostaywithhersister-
in-lawaftertheincident.Wewill
gettoknowabouttheactualrea-
sonoftheincidentandanyother
abusethatshemighthavefaced
atthehandsof theaccusedafter
talking toher,” saidTogas.
According to police,

Meghwal is unemployed and
liveswith hismother in the vil-
lage.Hehadmarriedthewoman
around six months back and
sincethenhehadconstantfights
with her. His neighbours said
Meghwal was an alcoholic and
regularly thrashed his wife. He
did not let her talk to anyone in
thevillageeither.
Togas said thematter is be-

ing investigated.

Man arrested for tying
wife to bike, dragging
her around village

Asaram granted parole for ayurvedic treatment in Maharahstra
Asaramis
nowunder
treatmentat
AIIMS,
Jodhpur
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SCHOOLSWERE shut in several
districts on Tuesday as heavy
rainfallcontinuedtobatterparts
of the state where 22 people
died in rain-related incidents in
twodays.
Chief Minister Bhajan Lal

Sharmaconductedanaerialsur-
vey of rain-hit areas in Dausa,
Karauli and Bharatpur districts
while BJP leader Kirodi Lal
Meenatookpartinafieldsurvey
andmetofficials inDausa.
Meena recently resigned

fromtheCabinet and isnot tak-

ingpart inofficialmeetings.
Awarning for heavy to very

heavy rainfall is in place for

WednesdayinBharatpur,Ajmer,
Jaipur and Kota divisions. In
someareasofeasternRajasthan,
moderate toheavyrainmayoc-
curonThursdayandFriday.
For Tuesday, a 'red' warning

wasissuedforBaran,Bundi,Kota
and Tonk districts and an 'or-
ange'alert forBharatpur,Dausa,
Dholpur, JaipurandKarauli.
The administration has de-

clared holidays in schools in
thesedistricts.
Inthe24hoursendedat8:30

amonTuesday,MahuainDausa
recorded the highest rainfall at
163mm,theMetcentreinJaipur
said. Nainwa in Bundi recorded
161mmrainfall, Jaipur152mm

andMadhorajpura in Jaipur136
mm—all inthecategoryofvery
heavyrain.
Torrential rain during the

past couple of days has caused
waterlogginginseveraldistricts,
withNationalDisasterResponse
Force (NDRF) andStateDisaster
Response Force (SDRF) teams
rescuingmore than 100 people
fromaffectedareas.
The continuous heavy rain

has led to flood-like conditions
inKaraulidistrictandnearbyar-
eas where overflowing dams
and rivers have disrupted daily
life.At least22peoplehavedied
in rain-related incidents in
RajasthansinceAugust11.

ChiefMinisterBhajanLalSharmaflagsoffa‘Tiranga
marathon’,organisedbytheJaipurGreaterMunicipal
Corporation,fromAlbertHallinJaipur,Tuesday.RohitJainParas

Schools in several districts shut as rain wreaks havoc

CMSharmasurveysrain-hit
areas inDausa,Karauliand
Bharatpurdistricts.
X/@BhajanlalBjp

Jaipur Jaipur


